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Hong Kong Exchanges and Clearing Limited and The Stock Exchange of Hong Kong Limited 
(the “Stock Exchange”) take no responsibility for the contents of this announcement, make 
no representation as to its accuracy or completeness and expressly disclaim any liability 
whatsoever for any loss howsoever arising from or in reliance upon the whole or any part of 
the contents of this announcement.
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(Stock Code: 8431) 

APPOINTMENT OF EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR

This announcement is made by Hao Bai International (Cayman) Limited (the “Company”, 
together with its subsidiaries, the “Group”) pursuant to Rule 17.50(2) of the Rules (the “GEM 
Listing Rules”) Governing the Listing of Securities on GEM of The Stock Exchange of Hong 
Kong Limited (the “Stock Exchange”).

APPOINTMENT OF EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR

The Board announces that Mr. Chung Yu Ching (鍾裕青) has been appointed as an executive 
Director of the Company with effect from 22 May 2024.

Mr. Chung, aged 67, obtained his Bachelor of Law from The China University of Political 
Science and Law and Certificate of Estate Management from The Hong Kong Polytechnic 
University. Mr. Chung has over 40 years of work experience in construction and property 
development. Between 1977 and 1987, he worked as a Land Inspector at the Lands 
Department and Assistant to the Chief Director of the Yuen Long Lands Office, responsible 
for land management in Yuen Long District. He has also worked as a supervisor of the 
General Manager Department of Henderson Land Development Co., Ltd. between 1988 and 
1990. Between 1990 and 1994, he worked as a consultant to assist Japan Golf Co., Ltd., in 
acquiring approximately 650,000 square meters of Chiu Keng Tsuen next to Fanling Golf 
Course. Mr. Chung founded E & S Consultants Services Limited (偉豐顧問有限公司) in 1994 
which has assisted many property developers to develop various estate projects in Hong Kong.

Mr. Chung has entered into a service agreement (the “Service Agreement”) with the 
Company and the service agreement may be terminated by either party by written notice of 
not less than one month. He is subject to retirement and re-election in accordance with the 
Articles of Association of the Company. Mr. Chung is entitled to a basic salary of HK$20,000 
per month plus a discretionary bonus, which shall be determined with reference to his duties, 
responsibilities and experience, and to prevailing market conditions, and is subject to annual 
review by the remuneration committee of the Company.
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Save as disclosed above, Mr. Chung (i) has not held any other positions with any members of 
the Group; (ii) is not related to any Directors, senior management or substantial shareholders 
or the controlling shareholders (as defined under the GEM Listing Rules) of the Company; (iii) 
is not interested in the shares of the Company within the meaning of Part XV of the Securities 
and Futures Ordinance (Chapter 571 of the Laws of Hong Kong); (iv) has not held any other 
directorships in any other listed public companies in the last three years as at the date of this 
announcement; and (v) there are no other matters relating to the appointment of Mr. Chung 
that need to be brought to the attention of holders of securities of the Company and there is no 
other information that should be disclosed pursuant to the requirements of Rule 17.50(2) of 
the GEM Listing Rules.

The Board would like to take this opportunity to express its warmest welcome to Mr. Chung 
in joining the Company.

By order of the Board
Hao Bai International (Cayman) Limited

Shu Zhongwen
Chief Executive Officer and Executive Director

Hong Kong, 22 May 2024

As at the date of this announcement, the executive Directors are Mr. Shu Zhongwen, Ms. 
Wong Wing Hung, Mr. Ng Wan Lok, Mr. Wang Xinliang and Mr. Chung Yu Ching; and the 
independent non-executive Directors are Mr. Ma Meng, Mr. Li Ruyi, Mr. Yuen Wai Keung and 
Mr. Cheung Hiu Fung.

This announcement, for which the Directors collectively and individually accept full 
responsibility, includes particulars given in compliance with the Rules Governing the Listing 
of Securities on GEM of The Stock Exchange of Hong Kong Limited for the purpose of 
giving information with regard to the Company. The Directors, having made all reasonable 
enquiries, confirm that to the best of their knowledge and belief the information contained in 
this announcement is accurate and complete in all material respects and not misleading or 
deceptive, and there are no other matters the omission of which would make any statement 
herein or this announcement misleading.

This announcement will remain on the “Latest Listed Company Information” page of the 
Stock Exchange at www.hkexnews.hk for at least seven days from the date of its posting. 
This announcement will also be published and remained on the Company’s website at 
http://www.irasia.com/listco/hk/haobai/.


